








4.  Document II:  Excerpt from Gov. Joseph Brown's Open Letter to the state of Georgia

printed in the “Southern Banner of Athens” (Link to full document) 

... What effect will the abolition of slavery have upon the interest and social position of the 
large class of nonslaveholders and poor white laborers in the South? Here would be the 
scene of the most misery and ruin. Probably no one is so unjust as to say that it would be 
right to take from the slaveholder his property without paying for it. What would it cost to 
do this? There are, in round numbers, 4,500,000 slaves in the Southern States. They are 
worth, at a low estimate, 500 dollars each. All will agree to this. Multiply the 4,500,000 by 
the 500 and you have twenty-two hundred and fifty millions of dollars, which these slaves 
are worth. No one would agree that it is right to rob the Southern slaveholders of this vast 
sum of money without compensation. The Northern States would not agree to pay their 
proportion of the money, and the people of the South must be taxed to raise the money. If 
Georgia were only an average Southern State, she would have to pay one fifteenth part of 
this sum, which would be $150,000,000. Georgia is much more than an average State, and 
she must therefore pay a larger sum. Her people now pay less than half a million dollars a 
year, of tax. Suppose we had ten years within which to raise the $150,000,000, we whould 
then have to raise, in addition to our present tax, $15,000,000 per annum, or over thirty 
times as much as we now pay.-- The poor man, who now pays one dollar, would then have 
to pay $30.00. But suppose the Northern States agreed to help pay for these slaves, (who 
believes they would do it?) the share of Georgia would then be about one thirtieth of the 
twenty-two hundred and fifty millions of dollars, or over seventy-five millions; which, if 
raised in ten years, would be over fifteen times as much as our present tax. In this 
calculation, I have counted the slave-holder as taxed upon his own slaves to raise money to 
pay him for them. This would be a great injustice to him. If the sum is to be raised by the tax
upon others, the nonslaveholders and poor white men of the South, would have to pay nearly
the whole of this enormous sum, out of their labor. This would load them and their children 
with grievous indebtedness and heavy taxes for a long time to come. But suppose we were 
rid of this difficulty, what shall be done with these 4,500,000 negroes, when set free? Some 
of the Northern States have already passed laws prohibiting free negroes from coming into 
their limits. They will help to harbor our runaway slaves, but will not receive among them 
our free negroes. They would not permit them to go there and live with them. Then what? 
One may say, send them to Africa. To such a proposition I might reply, send them to the 
moon. You may say that is not practicable. It is quite as much so as it is for us to pay for and 
send this vast number of negroes to Africa, with the means at our command. ...

5.  Document III:  Letter from Thomas R.R. Cobb to Howell Cobb, c. 3 April 1850:

Hargrett Library, Howell Cobb Collection, Genealogy, MS 1367,

University of Georgia

“The slaveholders are all agog and making a miserable noise. ... While the mass[,] 
[know]ing nothing and caring nothing about it, are normally attached to the Union, much 
more so than I had supposed. The misery is that they have no mouthpiece, while the other 
brawlers are manufacturing a spurious public sentiment into which all will eventually fall.”
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